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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Print Shop Equipment and Services

FOR:  

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 7, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1

 PRICE

1. ITEM DELETED TOTAL

 PRICE

2. ITEM DELETED TOTAL

 PRICE

3. ITEM DELETED TOTAL

 PRICE

4. ITEM DELETED TOTAL

 PRICE

5. ITEM DELETED TOTAL

 
 
   
 
 
 
 PRICE

6. ITEM DELETED TOTAL

GROUP 1 TOTAL TOTAL

GROUP 2

1 ea. PRICE 22,269.13 38,250.00 38,361.00
1. Paper Cutter TOTAL NO BID 22,269.13 38,250.00 38,361.00

10 ea. PRICE 120.00 5,937.00 1,986.00
2. Maintenance-One to Two onsite visits per year for five years TOTAL NO BID 1,200.00 59,370.00 19,860.00

1 ea. PRICE 365.00 1,500.00 0.00
3. Training TOTAL NO BID 365.00 1,500.00 0.00

1 ea. PRICE 0.00 0.00 0.00
4. Travel TOTAL NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00

1 ea. PRICE 1,495.00 0.00 1,880.00
5. Warranty-To cover the initial purchase and one additional year TOTAL NO BID 1,495.00 0.00 1,880.00

1 ea.
Trade In Offer

Model: 320C
Manufacturer: ProCut/Swaneck
S/N:   60194 PRICE 200.00

6. Age:  70 yrs. TOTAL NO BID 0.00 0.00 200.00
 *
  

GROUP 2 TOTAL TOTAL 25,329.13 99,120.00 60,301.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Print Shop Equipment and Services

FOR:  

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 7, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY A
C
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GROUP 3  
1 ea. PRICE 2,400.00 7,237.50 4,995.00

1. Punch Machine TOTAL 2,400.00 7,237.50 4,995.00 NO BID

Item #7705634 (DIE MAGNA 2.0 ColorCoil 4:1 .2475 RND) 530.00
Item #7705641 (DIE MAGNA 2.0 3-5-7/2-4 RND) 530.00
TOTAL TOTAL 1,060.00
 
10 ea. PRICE 430.65 120.00 750.00

2. Maintenance-One to Two onsite visits per year for five years TOTAL 4,306.50 1,200.00 7,500.00 NO BID

*If purchased at 2 whole 5 years $430.65 if purchased together or $495.00 430.65
per year if purchased seperately

1 ea. PRICE 230.00 350.00 250.00

3. Training TOTAL 230.00 350.00 250.00 NO BID

1 ea. PRICE  0.00 0.00

4. Travel TOTAL  0.00 0.00 NO BID

1 ea. PRICE 700.00 0.00

5. Warranty-To cover the initial purchase and one additional year TOTAL 700.00 0.00 NO BID

1 ea.

Trade In Offer

 

Model: Magnapunch

Manufacturer: GBC

S/N PK00901 PRICE 0.00  

Age: 14 yrs. TOTAL N/A 0.00 N/A NO BID

*

 

GROUP 3 TOTAL TOTAL 6,936.50 9,487.50 12,745.00

GROUP 4  

1 ea. PRICE 5,995.00

1. Stretch Wrap Machine TOTAL NO BID NO BID 5,995.00 NO BID

 

10 ea. PRICE 950.00

2. Maintenance-One to Two onsite visits per year for five years TOTAL NO BID NO BID 9,500.00 NO BID

1 ea. PRICE 550.00

3. Training TOTAL NO BID NO BID 550.00 NO BID

1 ea. PRICE 0.00

4. Travel TOTAL NO BID NO BID 0.00 NO BID

1 ea. PRICE 0.00

5. Warranty-To cover the initial purchase and one additional year TOTAL NO BID NO BID 0.00 NO BID

*

PRICE

GROUP 4 TOTAL TOTAL  16,045.00

GROUP 5

1 ea. PRICE  10,599.00 12,500.00

1. Business Card Cutter TOTAL NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE 10,599.00 12,500.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Print Shop Equipment and Services

FOR:  

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 7, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY A
C
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10 ea. PRICE 1,600.00 1,861.00

2. Maintenance-One to Two onsite visits per year for five years TOTAL NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE 16,000.00 18,610.00

1 ea. PRICE 650.00 0.00

3. Training TOTAL NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE 650.00 0.00

1 ea. PRICE 0.00 0.00

4. Travel TOTAL NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE 0.00 0.00

1 ea. PRICE 0.00 1,960.00

5. Warranty-To cover the initial purchase and one additional year TOTAL NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE 0.00 1,960.00

 *

  

GROUP 5 TOTAL TOTAL 27,249.00 33,070.00

GROUP 6

1 ea. PRICE 4,986.56 7,695.00 8,368.00

1. Paper Drill TOTAL NO BID 4,986.56 7,695.00 8,368.00

 

10 ea. PRICE 120.00 1,147.00 1,024.00

2. Maintenance-One to Two onsite visits per year for five years TOTAL NO BID 1,200.00 11,470.00 10,240.00

1 ea. PRICE 365.00 495.00 0.00

3. Training TOTAL NO BID 365.00 495.00 0.00

1 ea. PRICE 0.00 0.00 0.00

4. Travel TOTAL NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00

1 ea. PRICE 295.00 0.00 1,420.00

5. Warranty-To cover the initial purchase and one additional year TOTAL NO BID 295.00 0.00 1,420.00

Trade In Offer

Model: JF

Manufacturer: Challenge

S/N: K14-10162-94 PRICE 0.00  50.00

6. Age: 24 TOTAL NO BID 0.00 N/A 50.00

*

GROUP 6 TOTAL TOTAL 6,846.56 19,660.00 20,078.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Print Shop Equipment and Services

FOR:  

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 7, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY A
C
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Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 3-5 days 10-15 days 21 days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:  

 
ACCO Brands USA Demandstar

Archive Suplies SAWS Website

Dahill

Documation Inc.

Litho Supply & Service Co.

LSS Digital 
 MBM Corp.

Shrink Film

4


